




Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 1 Albany $54.89 

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 1 Albany $56.00 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 1 Albany $56.69 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 1 Albany NB

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 1 Albany No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 1 Albany NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 2 Allegany $55.71 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 2 Allegany NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 2 Allegany no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 2 Allegany No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 2 Allegany No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 2 Allegany NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus $62.77 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 5 Cattaraugus NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua $71.55 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 7 Chautauqua NO BID

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 10 Clinton $84.75 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 10 Clinton $85.56 

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 10 Clinton $86.97 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 10 Clinton NB

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 10 Clinton No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 10 Clinton NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 14 Erie $58.33 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 14 Erie NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 14 Erie no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 14 Erie No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 14 Erie No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 14 Erie NO BID

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 17 Franklin $85.75 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 17 Franklin $88.08 

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 17 Franklin $88.58 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 17 Franklin NB

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 17 Franklin No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 17 Franklin NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans $55.42 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 19 Genesee & Orleans NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot I - Road Salt



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 23 Jefferson $72.76 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 23 Jefferson NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 23 Jefferson no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 23 Jefferson No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 23 Jefferson No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 23 Jefferson NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming $52.98 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 25 Livingston & Wyoming NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 27 Monroe $54.52 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 27 Monroe NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 27 Monroe no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 27 Monroe No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 27 Monroe No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 27 Monroe NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 29 Niagara $59.42 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 29 Niagara NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 29 Niagara no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 29 Niagara No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 29 Niagara No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 29 Niagara NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 32 Ontario $55.42 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 32 Ontario NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 32 Ontario no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 32 Ontario No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 32 Ontario No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 32 Ontario NO BID

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 34 Oswego $53.44 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 34 Oswego $57.02 

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 34 Oswego no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 34 Oswego No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 34 Oswego No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 34 Oswego NO BID

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer $54.89 

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer $57.00 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer $57.73 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer NB

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 37 Rensselaer NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence $92.35 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence NB

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 39 St. Lawrence NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot I - Road Salt



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 41 Schenectady $54.89 

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 41 Schenectady $55.75 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 41 Schenectady $58.01 

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 41 Schenectady $62.33 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 41 Schenectady NB

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 41 Schenectady No Bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 48 Warren $65.00 

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 48 Warren $68.89 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 48 Warren $70.16 

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 48 Warren $70.22 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 48 Warren $71.93 

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 48 Warren No Bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 49 Washington $62.40 

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 49 Washington $63.89 

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 49 Washington $64.06 

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 49 Washington $65.02 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 49 Washington NB

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 49 Washington No Bid

American Rock Salt Co., LLC I Road Salt 50 Wayne $54.90 

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety I Road Salt 50 Wayne $55.83 

Apalachee, LLC I Road Salt 50 Wayne no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 50 Wayne No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. I Road Salt 50 Wayne No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. I Road Salt 50 Wayne NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot I - Road Salt



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany $69.89

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany $74.04

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany $79.27

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 52 Albany NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua $81.87

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua NB

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 56 Chautauqua NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie $69.12

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie NB

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 60 Erie NO BID

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson $68.33

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson $82.79

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 67 Jefferson NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston $63.85

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston NB

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 69 Livingston NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe $64.87

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe NB

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 71 Monroe NO BID

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario $64.88

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario $65.45

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 77 Ontario NO BID

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer $72.89

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer $78.66

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer $86.66

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 79 Rensselaer NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot II - Treated Salt Type 1



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady $71.76

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady $72.89

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady $80.61

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 83 Schenectady NO BID

Apalachee, LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens $90.00

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens NB

American Rock Salt Co., LLC II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens No Bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. II Treated Salt Type 1 180 Queens NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot II - Treated Salt Type 1



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua $84.63

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 93 Chautauqua NO BID

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton $98.90

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton $115.60

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton $124.30

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton NB

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 94 Clinton NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie $72.18

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 97 Erie NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee $68.97

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 98 Genesee NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe $68.19

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 100 Monroe NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara $72.56

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 102 Niagara NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario $68.45

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 103 Ontario NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans $69.17

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 104 Orleans NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot III - Treated Salt Type 2



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence $115.60

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence $116.76

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 106 St. Lawrence NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne $68.37

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne NB

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne no bid

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 113 Wayne NO BID

American Rock Salt Co., LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida $80.00

Apalachee, LLC III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida $85.00

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida NB

Atlantic Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida No Bid

Compass Minerals America Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. III Treated Salt Type 2 181 Oneida NO BID

Bid Tabulations - Lot III - Treated Salt Type 2



Group 01800 - IFB 23175 Road Salt, Treated Salt Emergency Standby Road Salt Bid Tabulation

Contractor Lot Number Item Description

OGS Item 

Number County Price per Ton

Atlantic Salt, Inc. Storage Fee 1

Price per ton to stockpile 

salt on behalf of an 

Authorized User until 

December 31, 2019 (not 

to exceed $3.60 per ton). $3.50

American Rock Salt Co., LLC Storage Fee 1

Price per ton to stockpile 

salt on behalf of an 

Authorized User until 

December 31, 2019 (not 

to exceed $3.60 per ton). $3.60

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety Storage Fee 1

Price per ton to stockpile 

salt on behalf of an 

Authorized User until 

December 31, 2019 (not 

to exceed $3.60 per ton). $3.60

Morton Salt, Inc. Storage Fee 1

Price per ton to stockpile 

salt on behalf of an 

Authorized User until 

December 31, 2019 (not 

to exceed $3.60 per ton). $3.60

Compass Minerals America Inc. Storage Fee 1

Price per ton to stockpile 

salt on behalf of an 

Authorized User until 

December 31, 2019 (not 

to exceed $3.60 per ton). N/A

Atlantic Salt, Inc. Storage Fee 2

Price per ton per month 

to stockpile salt on 

behalf of an Authorized 

User after December 31, 

2019. $3.50

American Rock Salt Co., LLC Storage Fee 2

Price per ton per month 

to stockpile salt on 

behalf of an Authorized 

User after December 31, 

2019. $3.60

Morton Salt, Inc. Storage Fee 2

Price per ton per month 

to stockpile salt on 

behalf of an Authorized 

User after December 31, 

2019. $3.60

Cargill, Inc. - Salt, Road Safety Storage Fee 2

Price per ton per month 

to stockpile salt on 

behalf of an Authorized 

User after December 31, 

2019. $11.00

Compass Minerals America Inc. Storage Fee 2

Price per ton per month 

to stockpile salt on 

behalf of an Authorized 

User after December 31, 

2019.

$5.00 per ton 

per month

Storage Fees


