

Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER

23093

BID OPENING

1/17/2018

GROUP NUMBER

05800

PURCHASING OFFICER

Elizabeth Gocs

TELEPHONE-

(518) 486-1821

DESCRIPTION

Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) - Propane
(Statewide)



Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | <https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov> | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
--	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only	
Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov	
Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i> 14-719550	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 100007084			
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: Adirondack Energy Products, Inc				
D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable): Adirondack Propane				
Street 17 Junction Rd	City Malone	State NY	County Franklin	Zip Code 12953
E-mail Address: C.monette@aol.com		Company Web Site: www.adirondackenergy.com		

If applicable, place an "X" in the appropriate box(es) (check all that apply)			
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business 50 # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business

If you are not bidding, place an "X" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY				
LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: 2
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <i>[Signature]</i>



Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
--	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
---	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595
----------------	------------------------------

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i> 23-2787917	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 1000008932
--	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: AmeriGas Propane, L.P.

D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street 460 N Gulph Road	City King of Prussia	State PA	County Montgomery	Zip Code 19406
----------------------------	-------------------------	-------------	----------------------	-------------------

E-mail Address: dawn.stevenson@amerigas.com	Company Web Site: www.amerigas.com
--	---------------------------------------

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) (check all that apply)

<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	---	---	--

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: <u> 1 </u>
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <u> [Signature] </u>



Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | <https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov> | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
---	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
--------------------------------	---------------------------------

Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
---	---

Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
---	--	---

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595
----------------	------------------------------

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i> 431098481	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 100009351
--	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Ferrellgas LP

D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable):
Ferrellgas LP

Street 5859 State Route 31	City VERONA	State NY	County Oranget	Zip Code 13472
-------------------------------	----------------	-------------	-------------------	-------------------

E-mail Address: douglas.mvna@ferrellgas.com	Company Web Site: www.ferrellgas.com
---	---

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) (check all that apply)

<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	---	---	--

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <i>[Signature]</i>



Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
---	---

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
---	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown Telephone No. (518) 457-6595

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i> 141536614	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 1000006792
---	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: G.A. BOYE & SONS INC

D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street 76 BAILROAD STREET	City MECHANICVILLE	State NY	County SARATOGA	Zip Code 12118
E-mail Address:		Company Web Site: WWW.BOYEFUELS.COM		

If applicable, place an "X" in the appropriate box(es) (check all that apply)

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business 64 # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	---	---	--

If you are not bidding, place an "X" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: 1
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: [Signature]



Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | <https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov> | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
--	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284
	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015

For INSURANCE Questions Only	
Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov	
Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i>	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i>
--	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: <i>Mirabito Holdings, Inc.</i>				
D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable): <i>Mirabito Energy Products</i>				
Street <i>The Metrocenter - 49 Court St. P.O. Box 5306</i>	City <i>Binghamton</i>	State <i>NY</i>	County <i>Broome</i>	Zip Code <i>13902</i>
E-mail Address: <i>joe.destiemirabito.com</i>		Company Web Site: <i>WWW-mirabito.com</i>		

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) <i>(check all that apply)</i>			
<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY				
LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: <i>3</i>
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <i>[Signature]</i>



Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | <https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov> | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
---	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595
----------------	------------------------------

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i> 133149941	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 1000006312
---	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: Paraco Gas Corp

D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street <u>800 Westchester Ave</u>	City <u>Ryebrook</u>	State <u>NY</u>	County <u>Westchester</u>	Zip Code <u>10573</u>
--------------------------------------	-------------------------	--------------------	------------------------------	--------------------------

E-mail Address: amirchin@paracogas.com Company Web Site: www.paracogas.com

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) *(check all that apply)*

<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	---	---	--

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: Documented by: <u>[Signature]</u>
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		



Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
---	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595
----------------	------------------------------

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i>	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i> 1000001662			
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: <i>Porco Energy Corp</i>				
D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable):				
Street <i>PO Box 910</i>	City <i>Marlboro</i>	State <i>NY</i>	County <i>Ulster</i>	Zip Code <i>12542</i>
E-mail Address: <i>vporco@porcoenergy.com</i>		Company Web Site: <i>porcoenergy.com</i>		

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) (check all that apply)

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business <i>45# Employees</i>	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	--	--	---

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <i>[Signature]</i>

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 - Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) - Propane													
Attachment 1 - Pricing (Revision 2)													
Bidder: Adirondack Energy													
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Albany	494			618			N/A			115,000			
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900			203,700			
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237			504			16,830			
Chautauqua	160			230			750			27,700			
Chemung	100			N/A			40			8,600			
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500			
Clinton	300	\$ 3.4587	\$1,037.61	570	\$ 3.4587	\$1,971.45	490	\$ 2.9887	\$1,464.46	78,000	\$ 1.7245	\$134,511.00	\$138,984.52
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150			30,400			
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800			
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75			155,400			
Dutchess	N/A			15			1,250			286,897			
Erie	N/A			1,185			185			6,550			
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			360,050	\$ 1.6355	\$588,861.77	\$588,861.77
Franklin	50	\$ 3.4587	\$172.93	50	\$ 3.4587	\$172.93	100	\$ 2.9887	\$298.87	92,730	\$ 1.6945	\$157,130.98	\$157,775.71
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700			
Genesee	19			40			N/A			5,202			
Greene	N/A			N/A			100			23,000			
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251			10,501			
Jefferson	100			100			900			138,770			
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900			
Livingston	42			16			N/A			54,050			
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700			
Monroe	38			279			N/A			44,000			
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450			
Nassau	6			N/A			500			7,970			
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Oneida	3,500			94			1,268			74,750			
Onondaga	50			1,000			750			22,600			
Ontario	70			250			1,000			19,609			
Orange	60			810			200			192,990			
Orleans	N/A			200			1,330			17,100			
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960			
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350			41,700			
Putnam	N/A			80			2,000			53,081			
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000			
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216			2,525			4,570			86,700			
Saratoga	100			300			2,918			50,620			
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000			250			
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100			
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150			
Seneca	N/A			237			972			38,300			
St. Lawrence	N/A			120			13,000			31,900			
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600			
Suffolk	305			430			24,960			125,400			
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Tioga	36			126			350			7,900			
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40			15,200			
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205			168,180			
Warren	150			600			1,200			191,450			
Washington	N/A			N/A			250			66,200			

Bidder:	Adirondack Energy												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Adirondack Energy Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Wayne	10			204			50			25,724			
Westchester	20			120			22,050			246,671			
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945			
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 2)													
Bidder: AmeriGas Propane, L.P.													
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Albany	494	\$ 2.7200	\$1,343.68	618	\$ 2.7200	\$1,680.96	N/A			115,000	\$ 1.6244	\$186,806.00	\$189,830.64
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900	\$ 2.7200	\$2,448.00	203,700	\$ 1.6244	\$330,890.28	\$333,338.28
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900	\$ 2.7200	\$5,168.00	135,200	\$ 1.6140	\$218,212.80	\$223,380.80
Cayuga	N/A			237	\$ 3.2200	\$763.14	504	\$ 2.7200	\$1,370.88	16,830	\$ 1.6640	\$28,005.12	\$30,139.14
Chautauqua	160	\$ 3.7200	\$595.20	230	\$ 3.2200	\$740.60	750	\$ 2.7200	\$2,040.00	27,700	\$ 1.6140	\$44,707.80	\$48,083.60
Chemung	100	\$ 3.7200	\$372.00	N/A			40	\$ 2.7200	\$108.80	8,600	\$ 1.6240	\$13,966.40	\$14,447.20
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500	\$ 1.6244	\$15,431.80	\$15,431.80
Clinton	300	\$ 3.7200	\$1,116.00	570	\$ 3.2200	\$1,835.40	490	\$ 2.7200	\$1,332.80	78,000	\$ 1.6240	\$126,672.00	\$130,956.20
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150	\$ 2.7200	\$408.00	30,400	\$ 1.6244	\$49,381.76	\$49,789.76
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800	\$ 1.6240	\$20,787.20	\$20,787.20
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75	\$ 2.7200	\$204.00	155,400	\$ 1.6244	\$252,431.76	\$252,635.76
Dutchess	N/A			15	\$ 3.2200	\$48.30	1,250	\$ 2.7200	\$3,400.00	286,897	\$ 1.6244	\$466,035.48	\$469,483.78
Erie	N/A			1,185	\$ 3.2200	\$3,815.70	185	\$ 2.7200	\$503.20	6,550	\$ 1.6240	\$10,637.20	\$14,956.10
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			360,050	\$ 1.5440	\$555,917.20	\$555,917.20
Franklin	50	\$ 3.7200	\$186.00	50	\$ 3.2200	\$161.00	100	\$ 2.7200	\$272.00	92,730	\$ 1.6240	\$150,593.52	\$151,212.52
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700	\$ 1.6140	\$144,775.80	\$144,775.80
Genesee	19	\$ 3.7200	\$70.68	40	\$ 3.2200	\$128.80	N/A			5,202	\$ 1.6640	\$8,656.12	\$8,855.60
Greene	N/A			N/A			100	\$ 2.7200	\$272.00	23,000	\$ 1.6244	\$37,361.20	\$37,633.20
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280	\$ 2.7200	\$761.60	21,858	\$ 1.5940	\$34,841.65	\$35,603.25
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251	\$ 2.7200	\$3,402.72	10,501	\$ 1.6140	\$16,948.61	\$20,351.33
Jefferson	100	\$ 3.7200	\$372.00	100	\$ 3.2200	\$322.00	900	\$ 2.7200	\$2,448.00	138,770	\$ 1.5940	\$221,199.38	\$224,341.38
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900	\$ 1.6240	\$61,549.60	\$61,549.60
Livingston	42	\$ 3.7200	\$156.24	16	\$ 3.2200	\$51.52	N/A			54,050	\$ 1.6240	\$87,777.20	\$87,984.96
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700	\$ 1.6244	\$41,747.08	\$41,747.08
Monroe	38	\$ 3.7200	\$141.36	279	\$ 3.2200	\$898.38	N/A			44,000	\$ 1.6240	\$71,456.00	\$72,495.74
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450	\$ 1.5940	\$32,597.30	\$32,597.30
Nassau	6	No Bid	#VALUE!	N/A		#VALUE!	500	No Bid	#VALUE!	7,970	No Bid	#VALUE!	#VALUE!
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.6640	\$28,454.40	\$28,454.40
Oneida	3,500	\$ 3.7200	\$13,020.00	94	\$ 3.2200	\$302.68	1,268	\$ 2.7200	\$3,448.96	74,750	\$ 1.5940	\$119,151.50	\$135,923.14
Onondaga	50	\$ 3.7200	\$186.00	1,000	\$ 3.2200	\$3,220.00	750	\$ 2.7200	\$2,040.00	22,600	\$ 1.5940	\$36,024.40	\$41,470.40
Ontario	70	\$ 3.7200	\$260.40	250	\$ 3.2200	\$805.00	1,000	\$ 2.7200	\$2,720.00	19,609	\$ 1.6240	\$31,845.01	\$35,630.41
Orange	60	\$ 3.7200	\$223.20	810	\$ 3.2200	\$2,608.20	200	\$ 2.7200	\$544.00	192,990	\$ 1.6244	\$313,492.95	\$316,868.35
Orleans	N/A			200	\$ 3.2200	\$644.00	1,330	\$ 2.7200	\$3,617.60	17,100	\$ 1.6240	\$27,770.40	\$32,032.00
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960	\$ 1.5940	\$86,012.24	\$86,012.24
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350	\$ 2.7200	\$3,672.00	41,700	\$ 1.6244	\$67,737.48	\$71,409.48
Putnam	N/A			80	\$ 3.2200	\$257.60	2,000	\$ 2.7200	\$5,440.00	53,081	\$ 1.6244	\$86,224.77	\$91,922.37
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000	\$ 1.6244	\$40,610.00	\$40,610.00
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216	\$ 3.7200	\$803.52	2,525	\$ 3.2200	\$8,130.50	4,570	\$ 2.7200	\$12,430.40	86,700	\$ 1.6244	\$140,835.48	\$162,199.90
Saratoga	100	\$ 3.7200	\$372.00	300	\$ 3.2200	\$966.00	2,918	\$ 2.7200	\$7,936.96	50,620	\$ 1.6244	\$82,227.12	\$91,502.08
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000	\$ 2.7200	\$8,160.00	250	\$ 1.6244	\$406.10	\$8,566.10
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100	\$ 1.5940	\$94,205.40	\$94,205.40
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150	\$ 1.5940	\$20,961.10	\$20,961.10
Seneca	N/A			237	\$ 3.2200	\$763.14	972	\$ 2.7200	\$2,643.84	38,300	\$ 1.6240	\$62,199.20	\$65,606.18
St. Lawrence	N/A			120	\$ 3.2200	\$386.40	13,000	\$ 2.7200	\$35,360.00	31,900	\$ 1.7140	\$54,676.60	\$90,423.00
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600	\$ 1.5940	\$112,536.40	\$112,536.40
Suffolk	305	No Bid	#VALUE!	430	No Bid	#VALUE!	24,960	No Bid	#VALUE!	125,400	No Bid	#VALUE!	#VALUE!
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.6244	\$27,777.24	\$27,777.24
Tioga	36	\$ 3.7200	\$133.92	126	\$ 3.2200	\$405.72	350	\$ 2.7200	\$952.00	7,900	\$ 1.6244	\$12,832.76	\$14,324.40
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40	\$ 2.7200	\$108.80	15,200	\$ 1.6240	\$24,684.80	\$24,793.60
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205	\$ 2.7200	\$8,717.60	168,180	\$ 1.6244	\$273,191.59	\$281,909.19
Warren	150	\$ 3.7200	\$558.00	600	\$ 3.2200	\$1,932.00	1,200	\$ 2.7200	\$3,264.00	191,450	\$ 1.5640	\$299,427.80	\$305,181.80
Washington	N/A			N/A			250	\$ 2.7200	\$680.00	66,200	\$ 1.6244	\$107,535.28	\$108,215.28
Wayne	10	\$ 3.7200	\$37.20	204	\$ 3.2200	\$656.88	50	\$ 2.7200	\$136.00	25,724	\$ 1.6240	\$41,775.77	\$42,605.85
Westchester	20	No Bid	#VALUE!	120	No Bid	#VALUE!	22,050	No Bid	#VALUE!	246,671	No Bid	#VALUE!	#VALUE!
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945	\$ 1.6240	\$163,934.68	\$163,934.68

Bidder:	AmeriGas Propane, L.P.												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			AmeriGas Propane, L.P.
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300	\$ 1.6240	\$23,223.20	\$23,223.20

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 1)													
Bidder:		Ferrellgas LP											
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Ferrellgas LP
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Albany	494			618			N/A			143,800			
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900	\$ 1.4965	\$1,346.85	203,700	\$ 1.4965	\$304,837.05	\$306,183.90
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237	\$ 1.6365	\$387.85	504	\$ 1.6365	\$824.79	16,830	\$ 1.5865	\$26,700.79	\$27,913.43
Chautauqua	109	\$ 2.2355	\$243.66	143	\$ 2.2355	\$319.67	750	\$ 2.0355	\$1,526.62	27,700	\$ 1.5065	\$41,730.05	\$43,820.00
Chemung	100	\$ 1.9365	\$193.65	N/A			40	\$ 1.9365	\$77.46	8,600	\$ 1.5365	\$13,213.90	\$13,485.01
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500	\$ 1.5065	\$14,311.75	\$14,311.75
Clinton	300			104			490			78,000			
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150			30,400			
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800	\$ 1.5065	\$19,283.20	\$19,283.20
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75			155,400			
Dutchess	N/A			15	\$ 1.4965	\$22.44	1,250	\$ 1.4965	\$1,870.62	286,897	\$ 1.4965	\$429,341.36	\$431,234.42
Erie	N/A			1,185	\$ 2.2355	\$2,649.06	185	\$ 2.2355	\$413.56	6,550	\$ 1.5065	\$9,867.57	\$12,930.19
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			620,050			
Franklin	50			50			100			92,730			
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700	\$ 1.4965	\$134,236.05	\$134,236.05
Genesee	19	\$ 2.1265	\$40.40	40	\$ 2.1265	\$85.06	N/A			5,202	\$ 1.5365	\$7,992.87	\$8,118.33
Greene	N/A			N/A			100			23,000			
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251	\$ 1.5065	\$1,884.63	10,501	\$ 1.5065	\$15,819.75	\$17,704.38
Jefferson	100	\$ 1.8365	\$183.65	100	\$ 1.7365	\$173.65	900	\$ 1.7365	\$1,562.85	138,770	\$ 1.4864	\$206,267.72	\$208,187.87
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900	\$ 1.4865	\$56,338.35	\$56,338.35
Livingston	42	\$ 1.9365	\$81.33	16	\$ 1.9365	\$30.98	N/A			54,050	\$ 1.5055	\$81,372.27	\$81,484.58
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700	\$ 1.5055	\$38,691.35	\$38,691.35
Monroe	38	\$ 1.8955	\$72.02	279	\$ 1.8955	\$528.84	N/A			44,000	\$ 1.4955	\$65,802.00	\$66,402.86
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450	\$ 1.5965	\$32,648.42	\$32,648.42
Nassau	6			N/A			500			7,970			
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.5865	\$27,129.15	\$27,129.15
Oneida	3,500	\$ 1.7364	\$6,077.40	94	\$ 1.7364	\$163.22	1,268	\$ 1.7364	\$2,201.75	74,750	\$ 1.4855	\$111,041.12	\$119,483.49
Onondaga	50	\$ 1.5365	\$76.82	1,000	\$ 1.5365	\$1,536.50	750	\$ 1.5365	\$1,152.37	22,600	\$ 1.5365	\$34,724.90	\$37,490.59
Ontario	70	\$ 1.7365	\$121.55	250	\$ 1.7365	\$434.12	1,000	\$ 1.7365	\$1,736.50	19,609	\$ 1.5365	\$30,129.22	\$32,421.39
Orange	60	\$ 1.4965	\$89.79	810	\$ 1.4965	\$1,212.16	200	\$ 1.4965	\$299.30	192,990	\$ 1.4965	\$288,809.53	\$290,410.78
Orleans	N/A			200	\$ 1.8255	\$365.10	1,330	\$ 1.8255	\$2,427.91	17,100	\$ 1.5255	\$26,086.05	\$28,879.06
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960			
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350			41,700			
Putnam	N/A			80			2,000			53,081			
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000	\$ 1.5865	\$39,662.50	\$39,662.50
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216	\$ 1.4964	\$323.22	2,525	\$ 1.4965	\$3,778.66	4,570	\$ 1.4965	\$6,839.00	86,700	\$ 1.4965	\$129,746.55	\$140,687.43
Saratoga	100	\$ 1.9265	\$192.65	300	\$ 1.9265	\$577.95	2,918	\$ 1.6265	\$4,746.12	50,620	\$ 1.6265	\$82,333.43	\$87,850.15
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000	\$ 1.6665	\$4,999.50	250	\$ 1.6665	\$416.62	\$5,416.12
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100	\$ 1.5065	\$89,034.15	\$89,034.15
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150	\$ 1.5365	\$20,204.97	\$20,204.97
Seneca	N/A			237	\$ 1.7265	\$409.18	972	\$ 1.5265	\$1,483.75	38,300	\$ 1.5265	\$58,464.95	\$60,357.88
St. Lawrence	N/A			120	\$ 1.7365	\$208.38	13,000	\$ 1.5865	\$20,624.50	31,900	\$ 1.5865	\$50,609.35	\$71,442.23
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600	\$ 1.5355	\$108,406.30	\$108,406.30
Suffolk	305			430			22,960			127,400			
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Tioga	36	\$ 1.9864	\$71.51	126	\$ 1.9864	\$250.28	350	\$ 1.9864	\$695.24	7,900	\$ 1.8864	\$14,902.56	\$15,919.59
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40	\$ 1.5365	\$61.46	15,200	\$ 1.5265	\$23,202.80	\$23,264.26
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205			168,180			
Warren	150			600			1,200			191,450			
Washington	N/A			N/A			250			66,200			

Bidder:	Ferrellgas LP												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Ferrellgas LP
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Wayne	10	\$ 1.7665	\$17.66	204	\$ 1.7665	\$360.36	50	\$ 1.7665	\$88.32	25,724	\$ 1.5665	\$40,296.64	\$40,762.98
Westchester	20			120			22,050			246,671			
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945	\$ 1.4865	\$150,054.74	\$150,054.74
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 1)													
Bidder:		G.A. Bove & Sons Inc.											
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Albany	494			618			N/A			143,800			
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900			203,700			
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237			504			16,830			
Chautauqua	109			143			750			27,700			
Chemung	100			N/A			40			8,600			
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500			
Clinton	300			104			490			78,000			
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150			30,400			
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800			
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75			155,400			
Dutchess	N/A			15			1,250			286,897			
Erie	N/A			1,185			185			6,550			
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			620,050			
Franklin	50			50			100			92,730			
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700			
Genesee	19			40			N/A			5,202			
Greene	N/A			N/A			100			23,000			
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251			10,501			
Jefferson	100			100			900			138,770			
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900			
Livingston	42			16			N/A			54,050			
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700			
Monroe	38			279			N/A			44,000			
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450			
Nassau	6			N/A			500			7,970			
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Oneida	3,500			94			1,268			74,750			
Onondaga	50			1,000			750			22,600			
Ontario	70			250			1,000			19,609			
Orange	60			810			200			192,990			
Orleans	N/A			200			1,330			17,100			
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960			
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350			41,700			
Putnam	N/A			80			2,000			53,081			
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000			
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216			2,525			4,570			86,700			
Saratoga	100	\$ 1.5045	\$150.45	300	\$ 1.5045	\$451.35	2,918	\$ 1.5045	\$4,390.13	50,620	\$ 1.5045	\$76,157.79	\$81,149.72
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000			250			
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100			
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150			
Seneca	N/A			237			972			38,300			
St. Lawrence	N/A			120			13,000			31,900			
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600			
Suffolk	305			430			22,960			127,400			
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Tioga	36			126			350			7,900			
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40			15,200			
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205			168,180			
Warren	150	\$ 1.5045	\$225.67	600	\$ 1.5045	\$902.70	1,200	\$ 1.5045	\$1,805.40	191,450	\$ 1.5045	\$288,036.52	\$290,970.29
Washington	N/A			N/A			250	\$ 1.5545	\$388.62	66,200	\$ 1.5545	\$102,907.90	\$103,296.52
Wayne	10			204			50			25,724			

Bidder: G.A. Bove & Sons Inc.													
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			G.A. Bove & Sons Inc.
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Westchester	20			120			22,050			246,671			
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945			
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 - Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) - Propane													
Attachment 1 - Pricing (Revision 2)													
Bidder: Mirabito Energy Products													
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Albany	494	\$ 1.8865	\$931.93	618	\$ 1.8865	\$1,165.85	N/A			115,000	\$ 1.5275	\$175,662.50	\$177,760.28
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900	\$ 1.5075	\$1,356.75	203,700	\$ 1.5075	\$307,077.75	\$308,434.50
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237			504			16,830			
Chautauqua	160			230			750			27,700			
Chemung	100			N/A			40			8,600			
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500	\$ 1.5675	\$14,891.25	\$14,891.25
Clinton	300			570			490			78,000			
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150			30,400			
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800	\$ 1.5875	\$20,320.00	\$20,320.00
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75	\$ 1.5551	\$116.63	155,400	\$ 1.5551	\$241,662.54	\$241,779.17
Dutchess	N/A			15			1,250			286,897			
Erie	N/A			1,185			185			6,550			
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			360,050			
Franklin	50			50			100			92,730			
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700			
Genesee	19			40			N/A			5,202			
Greene	N/A			N/A			100			23,000			
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251			10,501			
Jefferson	100			100			900			138,770			
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900			
Livingston	42			16			N/A			54,050			
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700	\$ 1.5966	\$41,032.62	\$41,032.62
Monroe	38			279			N/A			44,000			
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450			
Nassau	6			N/A			500			7,970			
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Oneida	3,500	\$ 1.8865	\$6,602.75	94	\$ 1.8865	\$177.33	1,268	\$ 1.5807	\$2,004.32	74,750	\$ 1.5807	\$118,157.32	\$126,941.72
Onondaga	50	\$ 1.8865	\$94.32	1,000	\$ 1.8865	\$1,886.50	750	\$ 1.5587	\$1,169.02	22,600	\$ 1.5587	\$35,226.62	\$38,376.46
Ontario	70			250			1,000			19,609			
Orange	60			810			200			192,990			
Orleans	N/A			200			1,330			17,100			
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960	\$ 1.5587	\$84,107.45	\$84,107.45
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350	\$ 1.5917	\$2,148.79	41,700	\$ 1.5917	\$66,373.89	\$68,522.68
Putnam	N/A			80			2,000			53,081			
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000	\$ 1.5818	\$39,545.00	\$39,545.00
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216			2,525			4,570			86,700			
Saratoga	100			300			2,918			50,620			
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000	\$ 1.6965	\$5,089.50	250	\$ 1.6965	\$424.12	\$5,513.62
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100	\$ 1.5587	\$92,119.17	\$92,119.17
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150			
Seneca	N/A			237			972			38,300			
St. Lawrence	N/A			120			13,000			31,900			
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600			
Suffolk	305			430			24,960			125,400			
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.5679	\$26,811.09	\$26,811.09
Tioga	36			126			350			7,900			
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40	\$ 1.5775	\$63.10	15,200	\$ 1.5775	\$23,978.00	\$24,041.10
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205			168,180			
Warren	150			600			1,200			191,450			
Washington	N/A			N/A			250			66,200			
Wayne	10			204			50			25,724			
Westchester	20			120			22,050			246,671			
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945			

Bidder:	Mirabito Energy Products												
	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Mirabito Energy Products
County	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 1)													
Bidder:		Paraco Gas Corp											
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Paraco Gas Corp
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Albany	494			618			N/A			143,800			
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900	\$ 1.5800	\$1,422.00	203,700	\$ 1.5800	\$321,846.00	\$323,268.00
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237			504			16,830			
Chautauqua	109			143			750			27,700			
Chemung	100			N/A			40			8,600			
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500			
Clinton	300	\$ -	#VALUE!	104		#VALUE!	490		#VALUE!	78,000		#VALUE!	#VALUE!
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150	\$ 1.5800	\$237.00	30,400	\$ 1.5800	\$48,032.00	\$48,269.00
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800			
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75	\$ 1.5400	\$115.50	155,400	\$ 1.5400	\$239,316.00	\$239,431.50
Dutchess	N/A			15	\$ 1.5340	\$23.01	1,250	\$ 1.5340	\$1,917.50	286,897	\$ 1.5340	\$440,099.99	\$442,040.50
Erie	N/A			1,185			185			6,550			
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			620,050			
Franklin	50			50			100			92,730			
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700			
Genesee	19			40			N/A			5,202			
Greene	N/A			N/A			100	\$ 1.5800	\$158.00	23,000	\$ 1.5800	\$36,340.00	\$36,498.00
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251			10,501			
Jefferson	100			100			900			138,770			
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900			
Livingston	42			16			N/A			54,050			
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700			
Monroe	38			279			N/A			44,000			
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450			
Nassau	6	\$ 1.9700	\$11.82	N/A			500	\$ 1.9700	\$985.00	7,970	\$ 1.9700	\$15,700.90	\$16,697.72
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Oneida	3,500			94			1,268			74,750			
Onondaga	50			1,000			750			22,600			
Ontario	70			250			1,000			19,609			
Orange	60	\$ 1.5390	\$92.34	810	\$ 1.5390	\$1,246.59	200	\$ 1.5390	\$307.80	192,990	\$ 1.5390	\$297,011.61	\$298,658.34
Orleans	N/A			200			1,330			17,100			
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960			
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350	\$ 1.5800	\$2,133.00	41,700	\$ 1.5800	\$65,886.00	\$68,019.00
Putnam	N/A			80	\$ 1.5950	\$127.60	2,000	\$ 1.5950	\$3,190.00	53,081	\$ 1.5950	\$84,664.19	\$87,981.79
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000			
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216	\$ 1.6090	\$347.54	2,525	\$ 1.6090	\$4,062.72	4,570	\$ 1.6090	\$7,353.13	86,700	\$ 1.6090	\$139,500.30	\$151,263.69
Saratoga	100			300			2,918			50,620			
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000			250			
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100			
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150			
Seneca	N/A			237			972			38,300			
St. Lawrence	N/A			120			13,000			31,900			
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600			
Suffolk	305	\$ 2.0800	\$634.40	430	\$ 2.0800	\$894.40	22,960	\$ 2.0800	\$47,756.80	127,400	\$ 2.0800	\$264,992.00	\$314,277.60
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.5390	\$26,316.90	\$26,316.90
Tioga	36			126			350			7,900			
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40			15,200			
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205	\$ 1.5390	\$4,932.49	168,180	\$ 1.5390	\$258,829.02	\$263,761.51
Warren	150			600			1,200			191,450			
Washington	N/A			N/A			250			66,200			

Bidder:	Paraco Gas Corp												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Paraco Gas Corp
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Wayne	10			204			50			25,724			
Westchester	20	\$ 1.6900	\$33.80	120	\$ 1.6900	\$202.80	22,050	\$ 1.6900	\$37,264.50	246,671	\$ 1.6900	\$416,873.99	\$454,375.09
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945			
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 1)													
Bidder:		Porco Energy Corp											
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Grand Total Bid per County
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	
Albany	494			618			N/A			143,800			
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900			203,700			
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900			135,200			
Cayuga	N/A			237			504			16,830			
Chautauqua	109			143			750			27,700			
Chemung	100			N/A			40			8,600			
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500			
Clinton	300			104			490			78,000			
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150			30,400			
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800			
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75			155,400			
Dutchess	N/A			15	\$ 1.6360	\$24.54	1,250	\$ 1.6360	\$2,045.00	286,897	\$ 1.6360	\$469,363.49	\$471,433.03
Erie	N/A			1,185			185			6,550			
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			620,050			
Franklin	50			50			100			92,730			
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700			
Genesee	19			40			N/A			5,202			
Greene	N/A			N/A			100			23,000			
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280			21,858			
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251			10,501			
Jefferson	100			100			900			138,770			
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900			
Livingston	42			16			N/A			54,050			
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700			
Monroe	38			279			N/A			44,000			
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450			
Nassau	6			N/A			500			7,970			
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100			
Oneida	3,500			94			1,268			74,750			
Onondaga	50			1,000			750			22,600			
Ontario	70			250			1,000			19,609			
Orange	60	\$ 1.6360	\$98.16	810	\$ 1.6360	\$1,325.16	200	\$ 1.6360	\$327.20	192,990	\$ 1.6360	\$315,731.64	\$317,482.16
Orleans	N/A			200			1,330			17,100			
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960			
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350			41,700			
Putnam	N/A			80	\$ 1.7360	\$138.88	2,000	\$ 1.7360	\$3,472.00	53,081	\$ 1.7360	\$92,148.61	\$95,759.49
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000			
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216	\$ 1.6560	\$357.69	2,525	\$ 1.6560	\$4,181.40	4,570	\$ 1.6560	\$7,567.92	86,700	\$ 1.6560	\$143,575.20	\$155,682.21
Saratoga	100			300			2,918			50,620			
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000			250			
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100			
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150			
Seneca	N/A			237			972			38,300			
St. Lawrence	N/A			120			13,000			31,900			
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600			
Suffolk	305			430			22,960			127,400			
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 1.6260	\$27,804.60	\$27,804.60
Tioga	36			126			350			7,900			
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40			15,200			
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205	\$ 1.6260	\$5,211.33	168,180	\$ 1.6260	\$273,460.68	\$278,672.01
Warren	150			600			1,200			191,450			
Washington	N/A			N/A			250			66,200			

Bidder:	Porco Energy Corp												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Porco Energy Corp
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Wayne	10			204			50			25,724			
Westchester	20	\$ 1.9360	\$38.72	120	\$ 1.9360	\$232.32	22,050	\$ 1.9360	\$42,688.80	246,671	\$ 1.9360	\$477,555.05	\$520,514.89
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945			
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300			

New York State Office of General Services - Procurement Services													
Invitation For Bids # 23093 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane													
Attachment 1 – Pricing (Revision 2)													
Bidder: Superior Plus Energy													
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Superior Plus Energy
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Albany	494	\$ 1.0500	\$518.70	618	\$ 1.0500	\$648.90	N/A			115,000	\$ 0.3794	\$43,631.00	\$44,798.60
Allegany	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Bronx	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Broome	N/A			N/A			900	\$ 1.0500	\$945.00	203,700	\$ 0.3379	\$68,830.23	\$69,775.23
Cattaraugus	N/A			N/A			1,900	\$ 1.0500	\$1,995.00	135,200	\$ 0.3579	\$48,388.08	\$50,383.08
Cayuga	N/A			237	\$ 1.0500	\$248.85	504	\$ 1.0500	\$529.20	16,830	\$ 0.4617	\$7,770.41	\$8,548.46
Chautauqua	160	\$ 1.0500	\$168.00	230	\$ 1.0500	\$241.50	750	\$ 1.0500	\$787.50	27,700	\$ 0.3775	\$10,456.75	\$11,653.75
Chemung	100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	N/A			40	\$ 1.0500	\$42.00	8,600	\$ 0.3989	\$3,430.54	\$3,577.54
Chenango	N/A			N/A			N/A			9,500	\$ 0.4500	\$4,275.00	\$4,275.00
Clinton	300	\$ 1.0500	\$315.00	570	\$ 1.0500	\$598.50	490	\$ 1.0500	\$514.50	78,000	\$ 0.3974	\$30,997.20	\$32,425.20
Columbia	N/A			N/A			150	\$ 1.0500	\$157.50	30,400	\$ 0.3551	\$10,795.04	\$10,952.54
Cortland	N/A			N/A			N/A			12,800	\$ 0.3587	\$4,591.36	\$4,591.36
Delaware	N/A			N/A			75			155,400	\$ -	\$0.00	
Dutchess	N/A			15			1,250			286,897	\$ -	\$0.00	
Erie	N/A			1,185	\$ 1.0500	\$1,244.25	185	\$ 1.0500	\$194.25	6,550	\$ 0.3679	\$2,409.74	\$3,848.24
Essex	N/A			N/A			N/A			360,050	\$ 0.4013	\$144,488.06	\$144,488.06
Franklin	50	\$ 1.0500	\$52.50	50	\$ 1.0500	\$52.50	100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	92,730	\$ 0.3561	\$33,021.15	\$33,231.15
Fulton	N/A			N/A			N/A			89,700	\$ 0.3591	\$32,211.27	\$32,211.27
Genesee	19	\$ 1.0500	\$19.95	40	\$ 1.0500	\$42.00	N/A			5,202	\$ 0.3891	\$2,024.09	\$2,086.04
Greene	N/A			N/A			100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	23,000	\$ 0.3681	\$8,466.30	\$8,571.30
Hamilton	N/A			N/A			280	\$ -	\$0.00	21,858	\$ -	\$0.00	
Herkimer	N/A			N/A			1,251	\$ -	\$0.00	10,501	\$ -	\$0.00	
Jefferson	100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	900	\$ 1.0500	\$945.00	138,770	\$ 0.3651	\$50,664.92	\$51,819.92
Kings	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Lewis	N/A			N/A			N/A			37,900	\$ 0.3781	\$14,329.99	\$14,329.99
Livingston	42	\$ 1.0500	\$44.10	16	\$ 1.0500	\$16.80	N/A			54,050	\$ 0.3813	\$20,609.26	\$20,670.16
Madison	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,700	\$ 0.3632	\$9,334.24	\$9,334.24
Monroe	38	\$ 1.0500	\$39.90	279	\$ 1.0500	\$292.95	N/A			44,000	\$ 0.3301	\$14,524.40	\$14,857.25
Montgomery	N/A			N/A			N/A			20,450	\$ 0.4601	\$9,409.04	\$9,409.04
Nassau	6	\$ -	\$0.00	N/A			500			7,970	\$ -	\$0.00	
New York	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Niagara	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ 0.4713	\$8,059.23	\$8,059.23
Oneida	3,500	\$ 1.0500	\$3,675.00	94	\$ 1.0500	\$98.70	1,268	\$ 1.0500	\$1,331.40	74,750	\$ 0.3311	\$24,749.72	\$29,854.82
Onondaga	50	\$ 1.0500	\$52.50	1,000	\$ 1.0500	\$1,050.00	750	\$ 1.0500	\$787.50	22,600	\$ 0.3341	\$7,550.66	\$9,440.66
Ontario	70	\$ 1.0500	\$73.50	250	\$ 1.0500	\$262.50	1,000	\$ 1.0500	\$1,050.00	19,609	\$ 0.3771	\$7,394.55	\$8,780.55
Orange	60	\$ 1.0500	\$63.00	810	\$ 1.0500	\$850.50	200	\$ 1.0500	\$210.00	192,990	\$ 0.3481	\$67,179.81	\$68,303.31
Orleans	N/A			200	\$ 1.0500	\$210.00	1,330	\$ 1.0500	\$1,396.50	17,100	\$ 0.3561	\$6,089.31	\$7,695.81
Oswego	N/A			N/A			N/A			53,960	\$ 0.3671	\$19,808.71	\$19,808.71
Otsego	N/A			N/A			1,350	\$ 1.0500	\$1,417.50	41,700	\$ 0.3391	\$14,140.47	\$15,557.97
Putnam	N/A			80	\$ -	\$0.00	2,000	\$ -	\$0.00	53,081	\$ -	\$0.00	
Queens	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rensselaer	N/A			N/A			N/A			25,000	\$ -	\$0.00	
Richmond	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			
Rockland	216	\$ 1.0500	\$226.80	2,525	\$ 1.0500	\$2,651.25	4,570	\$ 1.0500	\$4,798.50	86,700	\$ 0.4001	\$34,688.67	\$42,365.22
Saratoga	100	\$ 1.0500	\$105.00	300	\$ 1.0500	\$315.00	2,918	\$ 1.0500	\$3,063.90	50,620	\$ 0.3651	\$18,481.36	\$21,965.26
Schenectady	N/A			N/A			3,000	\$ -	\$0.00	250	\$ -	\$0.00	
Schoharie	N/A			N/A			N/A			59,100	\$ 0.3541	\$20,927.31	\$20,927.31
Schuyler	N/A			N/A			N/A			13,150	\$ 0.3771	\$4,958.86	\$4,958.86
Seneca	N/A			237	\$ 1.0500	\$248.85	972	\$ 1.0500	\$1,020.60	38,300	\$ 0.3771	\$14,442.93	\$15,712.38
St. Lawrence	N/A			120	\$ 1.0500	\$126.00	13,000	\$ 1.0500	\$13,650.00	31,900	\$ 0.3811	\$12,157.09	\$25,933.09
Steuben	N/A			N/A			N/A			70,600	\$ 0.3451	\$24,364.06	\$24,364.06
Suffolk	305	\$ -	\$0.00	430	\$ -	\$0.00	24,960	\$ -	\$0.00	125,400	\$ -	\$0.00	
Sullivan	N/A			N/A			N/A			17,100	\$ -	\$0.00	
Tioga	36	\$ 1.0500	\$37.80	126	\$ 1.0500	\$132.30	350	\$ 1.0500	\$367.50	7,900	\$ 0.6811	\$5,380.69	\$5,918.29
Tompkins	N/A			N/A			40	\$ 1.0500	\$42.00	15,200	\$ 0.3341	\$5,078.32	\$5,120.32
Ulster	N/A			N/A			3,205	\$ -	\$0.00	168,180	\$ -	\$0.00	
Warren	150	\$ 1.0500	\$157.50	600	\$ 1.0500	\$630.00	1,200	\$ 1.0500	\$1,260.00	191,450	\$ 0.3512	\$67,237.24	\$69,284.74
Washington	N/A			N/A			250	\$ 1.0500	\$262.50	66,200	\$ 0.3512	\$23,249.44	\$23,511.94
Wayne	10	\$ 1.0500	\$10.50	204	\$ 1.0500	\$214.20	50	\$ 1.0500	\$52.50	25,724	\$ 0.3811	\$9,803.41	\$10,080.61

Bidder:	Superior Plus Energy												
County	LPG - 20 lb./cyl (4.7 gal)			LPG - 34 lb./cyl (7.9 gal)			LPG - 100 lb./cyl (23.3 gal)			LPG - Bulk (gallons)			Superior Plus Energy
	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Estimated Quantity (gallons)	Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Grand Total Bid per County
Westchester	20	\$ -	\$0.00	120	\$ -	\$0.00	22,050	\$ -	\$0.00	246,671	\$ -	\$0.00	
Wyoming	N/A			N/A			N/A			100,945	\$ 0.2481	\$25,044.45	\$25,044.45
Yates	N/A			N/A			N/A			14,300	\$ 0.4513	\$6,453.59	\$6,453.59



Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | <https://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov> | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation for Bids

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2018 TIME: 1:00 P.M. EST INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: 23093	TITLE: Group 05800 – Liquefied Petroleum Gas (LPG) – Propane (Statewide) Classification Codes: 15 – Fuels & Lubricants
--	--

CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2020 with Renewal Options

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: In accordance with the Procurement Lobbying Law [State Finance Law § 139-j(2)(a)], the following individuals are the Designated Contacts for this Solicitation. All questions relating to this Solicitation must be addressed to the Designated Contacts.

Email Address: ogs.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

Elizabeth Gocs Contract Management Specialist Telephone No. (518) 486-1821 E-mail address: elizabeth.gocs@ogs.ny.gov	James Jasiewicz Team Leader Telephone No. (518) 486-5238 E-mail address: james.jasiewicz@ogs.ny.gov
--	--

For MWBE Questions Only	For SDVOB Questions Only
Email Address: MWBE@ogs.ny.gov	Email Address: VeteransDevelopment@ogs.ny.gov
Anuola Surgick Phone: (518) 486-9284	Anthony Tomaselli Phone No. (518) 474-2015
Tryphina Ramsey Phone: (518) 486-9284	

For INSURANCE Questions Only

Email Address: ogs.sm.insrev@ogs.ny.gov

Leighann Brown	Telephone No. (518) 457-6595
----------------	------------------------------

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: <i>(Do Not Use Social Security Number)</i>	NYS Vendor Identification Number: <i>(See New York State Vendor File Registration Clause)</i>
--	---

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: *Superior Plus Energy Services*

D/B/A – Doing Business As (if applicable): *Griffith / Yankee*

Street <i>1870 S.W. 7th Rd Suite 200</i>	City <i>Rochester</i>	State <i>NY</i>	County <i>Monroe</i>	Zip Code <i>14618</i>
---	--------------------------	--------------------	-------------------------	--------------------------

E-mail Address: <i>pwelker@superiorplusenergy.com</i>	Company Web Site: <i>www.superior-plus-energy.com</i>
--	--

If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate box(es) *(check all that apply)*

<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Small Business # Employees	<input type="checkbox"/> Service Disabled Veteran Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Minority Owned Business	<input type="checkbox"/> NYS Women Owned Business
--	---	---	--

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

WE ARE NOT BIDDING AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

FOR PROCUREMENT SERVICES USE ONLY

LITERATURE <input type="checkbox"/>	LETTER <input type="checkbox"/>	FLASH DRIVE <input type="checkbox"/>	OTHER <input type="checkbox"/>	# of Binders/Packages: <i>1</i>
PURC. MEMO <input type="checkbox"/>	CD/DVD <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	SDHC CARD <input type="checkbox"/>		Documented by: <i>[Signature]</i>