Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 22513
BID OPENING 10/24/2012
GROUP NUMBER 32100

PURCHASING OFFICER  Joseph Hodder

TELEPHONE (518) 474-3668

'DESCRIPTION

Treated Salt
(DOT and Others)




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower - 38thFloor '
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING | TITLE: Group 32100 - TREATED SALT
DATE: October 24, 2012 (DOT & Others) '
TIME: 11:00 AM .
: Classification Code(s):
INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE; o
22513 ' As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD: November 1, 2012 through October 31, 2013
- DESIGNATED CONTACTS: Team #6
Joseph Hodder , Team Leader Bruce Hallenbeck Assistant Director
Telephone No. (518) 474-3668 Telephone No. (518) 408-1705 :
E-mail address: joseph.hodder@ogs.ny.gov E-mail address: bruce.hallenbeck@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
Jj (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: http://www.ogs.ny.gov/aboutO s/regulations/defaultAdvisoryCouncil. html

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: " NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number). : (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

16-1516458 1000008297

If applicable, place an “x” in the apprdpriate box O NYS Small Business 0 Minority Owned [0 Women Owned
" (check all that apply): #Employees " Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
American Rock Salt Co., LLC"

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State Zip County
POBox 190, -~ Mt Morris, NY 14510 Livingston
. Ifapplicable, place an “x” in the appropriatebox ~ ¥3J Manufactured Within = 0J Manufactured Outside
(check all that apply): _New York State New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature: I ﬂ‘ M Printed or Typed Name:  Jystin Curley
Title: Bid Analyst } % | - Date: _Qctober 22, 2012

Phone : ( 585) / 243 - 9510 (. ext (1403 ) Toll FreePhone : (888) 762 - 7258 ext( )
‘| Fax :(585) 243- - 7676 ext ( ) Toll Free Fax () - ext ( )
E-mail Address: marcia.qavin®americ nrocksait.co ite:

PAGES - ]

,D

| P.R.#22513. - LIT O MEMO
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GROUP 32100 ~ TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 35 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= D D

Bidder .

-American. Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT 1- TYPE 1 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
Filed
OGS Require- | OGS Price/
County Item#  ment Item#  Unit
Albany 1 8,000 1 61.80 /Ton
Broome 2 200 2 $ _§_0_8_1_ /Ton
Columbia 3 200 3 $66.17/Ton
Cortland 4 1,500 4 $45.98/Ton
Essex 5 6,200 5 $.78.50/r,,
Franklin | _ 6 1,000 6 $ 76'33/1"on
Herkimer . 7 1,600 7 $.99.56/r0n
Jefferson 8 '1,800 8 $_6i_-§§/’1' on
Lewis 9 550 9 $_6ﬂ)_3/Ton
Madison 10 1,000 10 $ 55'28/Ton
Oneida ' 11 750 11 $ 54'98/Ton
Onondéga | 12 5,100 12 $_4;8£§j1‘on
Yoy & 13 130 | 13 $48.98 1,
Seneca 14 450 14 $45.97 /ron
Steuben 15 90 15 $48.99 rron
Sullivan 16 150 16 $64.02/Ton
Tompkins 17 500 17 $45.98/Ton
Warren 18 2,000 18 $.71.87 /Ton
Was.hi.ngton 19 350 19 5 _71.23m0n
(continued)

22513i.doc/T06jh

‘ Finished
Stockpile Product Salt
Location Name Color

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/BIué Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue
~Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Comers, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Biue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Comers, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Comers, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Comners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/Blue



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PageSof §
1OT1-TYPE1- GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
~ Filed Finished
OGS Require- | OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Salt
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location - Name Color
Chenango 30 200 30 $96.58Ton _Hampton Comers, NY/Blue Magic/Blue

22513p1/T06jh



GROUP 32100 —~TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 36 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR ‘TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

E A

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT 1-TYPE 1 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED (Cont’d)
State mix method as required by
Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:
If you are not the owner/operator of
the mine, have you submitted the
Certificate of Manufacturer Form on

Page 42?7

Number of tons of salt that constitute a
truckload delivery: 30 Tons

1

22513i.doc/T06jh

Conveyor Spraying
_American Rock Salt Co. . LLC

Hampton Corners, NY

Hampton vCorners. NY |

Hampton Corners, NY

(continued)

NO




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 37 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
"INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

b A —

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT 2- TYPE 2 - GRANULAR

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED & ORGANIC BASED
PERFORMANCE ENHANCER

Filed

oGS Require- | OGS Price/

County Item # ment Item # Unit
Albany 20 400 20  $.76.36/Ton
Clinton 21 2,500 21 $.95.55/10n
Dutchess 22 3,222 22 $.86.98 /Ton
Monroe 23 800 23 $55.05 /Ton
Ontario 24 1,000 24 $.55.15/Ton
Otsego 25 300 25 $.12.35 /Ton
Putnam 26 100 26  $.90.70 /Ton
St. Lawrence 27 500 27 $ 84.53 /Ton
Warren 28 302 | 28 §85.97 /1
Wayne 29 500 29  $59.95/Ton

State mix method as required by

Specification Item: Conveyor Spraying

. Finished
Stockpile Product Salt
Location Name Color

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Qrange
Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Hampton Corners, NY/Fire Rock/Orange

Name of Refiner: American Rock Salt Co., LLC
Location of Refinery: Hampton Corners, NY
Location of Mine: Hampton Corners, NY
Location of Stockpile: Hampton Corners, NY
{continued)

22513i.doc/T06jh



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 38 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE .
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= 0 D DD

Bidder

American Rock Salt co., LLC

INFORMATION TO BE FURNISHED BY BIDDERS:

L. Price per ton (not to exceed $3.60 per ton)
to stockpile on behalf of the end user -
and hold same in storage until December 31, 2013,

2a. If end user takes delivery of its
total annual filed requirement by
Januar 1, 2013 indicate discount
from bid price if any:

2b.  Ifaminimum tonnage is required
to qualify for the above discount,
indicate said quantity:

2c. Notwithstanding provisions under 2a
if end user guarantees that they will
take delivery of 90% of its annual filed
requirement by the end of the contract,
and advises contractor of this intention
by January 1, 2013 state discount from
bid price, if any:

2d. If a minimum tonnage is required to
qualify for the discount in 2¢ above,
. indicate said quantity:

3. Have you submitted Information on your Inhibitor
Treatment?
4, Are you in agreement to offering

a delayed billing program?

If yes, is your program the same as
stated in the Optional Delayed Billing
- Program clause herein?

If your program differs from the
specification as described, please
attach your program to your bid and
check here:

22513i.doc/T06jh

(continued)

$_3.60 ._perton
$__None per ton
N/A tons
$__ None per ton
N/A tons
X YES NO
YEs _ X No
YES NO




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower - 38thFloor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 32100 - TREATED SALT
DATE:  October 24, 2012 (DOT & Others)
TIME: 11:00 AM ‘

Classification Code(s):
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:

INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER:

22513 As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD: November 1, 2012 through October 31,2013
_ DESIGNATED CONTACTS: Team #6
Joseph Hodder Team Leader Bruce Hallenbeck Assistant Director

Telephone No. (518) 474-3668
E-mail address: joseph.hodder@ogs.ny.gov

Telephone No. (518) 408-1705
E-mail address: bruce.hallenbeck@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. B

yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowled

y signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
ge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard

Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
i 3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at:
Procurement Lobbying: http://www.ogs.ny.gov/aboutO
Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number)

s/regulations/defaultAdvisoryCouncil.htmi

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

41-0177680 1000048669 ‘
If applicable, place an “x™ in the appropriate box [0 NYS Small Business L] Minority Owned [ Women Owned
(check all that apply): #Employees Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Cargill, Incorporated

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing Technology Business Unit

City

Street State

24950 Countr

M Manufactured Within
New York State
page only.

- XX Manufactured Outside
(check all that apply): New York State
If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this '

0O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder's Signature: /Mﬂ f 'ﬂw .

1 Printed or Typed Name: Pamela S. Burcewicz

Title: Customer Solutions Specialist Date: October 19, 2012
Phone : (800) 600 - 7258  ext( ) Toll Free Phone : (800 ) 600 - 7258  ext( )
Fax  : (440) 71? - 0763  ext( ) Toll Free Fax () - ext( )
E-mail Address: pamela burcewicz@cargill.com Company Web Site: www,.cargilldeicing.com

LIT O MEMO O LET 0O OTHER O MISSING PAGES

| P.R. #22513

C-IlfB.dolx(07/ 12)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 35 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

‘BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'’S NAME IN THE BOX

D DD DD

Bidder

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing
Technology Business Unit

LOT 1- TYPE 1- GRANULAR

22513i.doc/T06jh

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED -
Filed
OGS Require-
County tem#  ment
Albany 1 8,000
Broome 2 200
Columbia 3 " 200
'Cénl;nd - 4 1,500
Essex s 6,200
Franklin 6 1,000
Herkimer 7 1,600
Jefferson 8 1,800
| Lewis 9 550
Madison 10 1,000
Oneida 11 750
Onondaga 12 . 5,100
Schuyler &
Yates 13 1,300
Seneca 14 -450
Steuben 15 - 90
Sullivan 16 150
Tompkins 17 500
Warren 18 2,600
Washington 19 350

OGS
Item #

1

2

10
11

12

13
14
15
16
17
18

19

Price/
Unit

$61.23 /Ton
$§_‘_‘-_9_4_/1' on
$70.25 /Ton
$ 48,73 /Ton
$72.08 /Ton

$73.77 /Ton
$60.87 /Ton

$66.02 /Ton
$68.72 /Ton
$Mf1‘ on
$57.84/Ton-
$_4_9-ﬁ/'1’ on

$50.23 /Ton

Stockpile
Location

Finished
Product
Name

ClearLan;@

Sait
Color

Green

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

Clea.rLane®

ClearLane®

.CléarLane®

Green

Green

Green

Lansing, NY

ClearLane®

Green

Clea;Lan@

Green

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY

ClearLane®

Clea;Lane®

ClearLane®~

Green

Green

Green

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY
Lansing, NY

Larnsing, NY

ClearLane

Green

ClearLane®

ClearLane

ClearLane@

Green

Green -

Green

$_-_5£-_6_3_/T on
$50.80 /Ton
$68.01 /Ton
$49.48 /Ton

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY
Lansing, NY

ClearLane®

‘Green

Cleartane®_crees

Green

Lansing s NY

ClearLane®

ClearLane@ Green

$69.65 /Ton
$ 72.55 /Ton

Lansing, NY

ClearLane®

Green

Lansing, NY

(continued)

ClearLane®

Green




GROUP 32100~ TREATED SALT (DOT & Others) Page 5 of §
LOT 1-TYPE 1- GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
Filed - . Finished

: OGS Require- | OGS Price/ _ Stockpile Product Salt
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color
Chenango 30 200 $97.45/ron Lansing, NY Clearlan@ Green

~ 22513pl/T06jh

30




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 36 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

D DD DD

Bidder
Cargill, Inc. - Deicing
Technology Business Unit

' LOT1-TYPE 1- GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION -
INHIBITED (Cont’d)
State mix method as required by
Specification [tem:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:
If you are not the owner/operator of
the mine, have you submitted the
Certificate of Manufacturer Form on

Page 42?

Number of tons of salt that constitute a
truckload delivery: = Tons

22513i.doc/T06jh

Screw Mix Corveyor

Cargill Salt

Lansing, NY

Lansing, NY
Lansing, NY

N/A

YES

NO

(continued)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 37 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D D DD DD

Bidder

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing
Technology Business Unit

LOT 2 - TYPE 2 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED

WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION )
INHIBITED & ORGANIC BASED
PERFORMANCE ENHANCER

Filed

OGS Require- | OGS Price/

County Item # ment Item # Unit
Albany © 20 400 20  $.86.3670,
Clinton .21 2,500 21§ 96.49Ton
Dutchess 22 3,222 22 . $.99,98Ton
Monroe 23 800 | 23 $ 72.54Ton
Ontario 24 1,000 24 $71.48 /Ton
Otsego 25 300 25 $86.90 /Ton
Putnam 26 100 26-  $92,05 /Ton
St. Lawrence 27 500 27 $95.90 /Ton
We_zrren 28 302 28 $93.75 /Ton
Wayne 29 500 29 $76.97 /Ton

State mix method as required by

, Finished
Stockpile Product Salt
Location - Name Color

Lansing, NY Clearlan@' Green

Lansing, NY _ngm@@_er_eﬂ.
Lansing, NY Clearlan@ Green

Lansing, NY Lls.arlgn@___Green _
Lansing, NY Clearlam.@ - Green

Laﬁs_ing_._NY Qlearlané® Green
Lansing, NY .Ciearlan(.@ Green

Lansing, NY _Ql&lzme@. _Green
Lansing, NY Clearlane® Green

Lansing, NY Cl_earlane@ Green

Specification Item: Screw Mix Conveyor
Name of Refiner: Cargill Salt
Location of Refinery: Lansing, NY _
" Location of Mine: Lansing, NY
Location of Stockpile: Lansing, NV
(continued)

22513i.doc/T06jh



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 38 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D DD DD

Bidder

Cargill, Inc. - Deicing
Technology Business Unit

INFORMATION TO BE FURNISHED BY BIDDERS:

L. Price per ton (not to exceed $3.60 per ton)
to stockpile on behalf of the end user
and hold same in storage until. December 31, 2013.

2a. If end user takes delivery of its
total annual filed requirement by
Januar 1, 2013 indicate discount
from bid price if any:

2b. If a minimum tonnage is required
to qualify for the above discount,
indicate said quantity:

2c. Notwithstanding provisions under 2a
if end user guarantees that they will
take delivery of 90% of its annual filed
requirement by the end of the contract,
. and advises contractor of this intention
by January 1, 2013 state discount from -
bid price, if any:

2d. If a minimum tonnage is required to
qualify for the discount in 2¢ above;
indicate said quantity:

3. Have you submitted Information on your Inhibitor
Treatment?
4. Are you in agreement to offering

a delayed billing program?

If yes, is your program the same as
stated in the Optional Delayed Billing
Program clause herein?

If your program differs from the
‘specification as described, please
attach your program to your bid and
check here:

: (continued)
22513i.doc/T06jh

§ 3.60

$ 0.00

N/A

$0.00

per ton

per ton

tons

per ton -

N/A tons
XX YES NO
YES XX NO
YES NO




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower - 38thFloor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242 ‘

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING ‘ TITLE: Group 32100 ~ TREATED SALT
DATE: October 24, 2012 ‘ (DOT & Others)
TIME: 11:00 AM

: ‘ Classification Code(s):
INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:

22513 . ‘ As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD: November 1, 2012 through October 31, 2013

‘ DESIGNATED CONTACTS: Team #6

Joseph Hodder Team Leader Bruce Hallenbeck Assistant Director
Telephone No. (518) 474-3668 - | Telephone No. (518) 408-1705
E-mail address: joseph.hodder@ogs.ny.gov E-mail address: bruce.hallenbeck@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedurés relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
j (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be aécessed at: :

Prqcurcment Lobbying: http://www.og_s.nyﬁv/abouto s/regulations/defau}tAdvisoryCouncil.html
Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: ‘  NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

52-2034785 1000009452

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box L] NYS Small Business O Minority Owned [J Women Owned
(check all that apply): , #Employees Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street ' City State Zip County
655 Northern Boulevard, Clarks Summit, PA - 18411 Lackawanna
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box O Manufactured Within Manufactured QOutside

(check all that apply): New York State - New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
0O WE ARE UNABRX, TO Bfp AT TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature: \ ~ \~ Printed or Typed Name: -
. \\ ) DANIEL P. THOMPSON
Title:CHLEF IVE OFFICER ' Date: October 18, 2012

Phone : (570) 587 - 5000  ext( ) Toll Free Phone : (888 ) 388  -4726 ext 2001)

Fax  :(570) 586 - 6463  ext( ) Toll Free Fax : (888 977  -2499 ext( )
E-mail Address: bidsg pany Web Sitexwww. internationalsalt.com

g i)

Flut

[PR#22513 it O MEMO LET T . OTHER i

C-IFB.dotx(07/12)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 35 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

5 9D D D

Bidder

INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

LOT 1- TYPE 1 - GRANULAR

22513i.doc/T065h

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
. CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
Filed
OGS Require-
County Item#  ment
Albany 1 8,000
Broome 2 200
Columbia 3 200
Cortland 4 1,500
Essex 5 6,200 ,
Franklin 6 1,000
Herkimer 7 1,600
Jefferson 8 1,800
Lewis 9 550
Madison 10 1,000
Oneida 11 750
Onondaga 12 5,100
Schuyler &
Yates 13 1,300
Seneca 14 450
Steuben 15 90
Sullivan 16 150
Tompkins 17 500
Warren 18 2,000
Washington 19 350

OGS
Item #

1

2

10
11

12

13
14
15
16
17
18

19

Price/
Unit

No Bid/Ton
Mo Bid/Ton
WNo Bid/Ton

Finished
Product
Name

Stockpile
Location

Salt
Color

WNo Bid/Ton

o . Bid/Ton
WNo Bid/Ton
o RBid/Ton
$NO_Bid/Ton

fo Bid/Ton

WNo Bid/Ton

- N0 Bid/Ton

- WNo Bid/Ton

" ®0_Bid /Ton

Mo Bid/Ton
WNo_Bid /Ton
WO Bid/Ton
o Bid /Ton
o Bid /Ton

WNo Bid/Ton

(continued)




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others) Page S of 5

LOT 1 -TYPE 1 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED

WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
Filed Finished
OGS Require- | OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Salt
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color
Chenango 30 200 30 $_No Bidron

22513p1/T06jh



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 36 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D 9SS D D

Bidder
ERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

LOT 1-TYPE 1- GRANULAR

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED

WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION -
INHIBITED (Cont’d)
State mix method as required by
Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:
If you are not the owner/operator of
the mine, have you submitted the
Certificate of Manufacturer Form on

Page 427

Number of tons of salt that constitute a
truckload delivery: Tons

22513i.doc/T06h

YES

NO

(continued) ‘



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 37 of 58
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC
> 252 ' ’
LOT 2 - TYPE 2 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION .
INHIBITED & ORGANIC BASED -
PERFORMANCE ENHANCER'
Filed Finished
OGS Require- | OGS Price/ Stockpile . Product Salt
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name -Color
Albany 20 400 20 .$67.61 /Ton Albany, NY Ice B' Gone _Rrownm
Clinton 21 2,500 21 $93.67 /Ton Albany, NY Tce B' Gope Rrowm
Dutchess 22 3,222 22 $77.59 /Ton Albany, NY Ice B' Gone Brown
Monroe 23 800 23 $No_BidTon
Ontario 24 1,000 24 $No Bid'Ton
Otsego 25 300 25 $73.83 /Ton Albany, NY IcLéBl_Gnne _Brown
Putnam 26 100 26  $81.38 /Ton Albany, NY Ice B' Gone _Brown
St. Lawrence 27 500 27 $No Bid'Ton
Warren 28 302 28 $77.57 /Ton Albanx, NY Ice B' Gone Brown
Wayne C29 500 29 $No Bid'Ton
State mix method as required by
Specification Item: ) Pug Mill and[or Stacking Conveyor
Name of Refiner; Sociedad Punta de Lobos
Location of Refinery: Port of Patillos, Chile
Location of Mine: Port of Patillos, Chile
Location of Stockpile: Albany, NY

: (continued)
22513i.doc/T06ih



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 38 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D DD DD

Bidder

INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

INFO

RMATION TQ BE FURNISHED BY BIDDERS:

L.

2a.

2b.

2c.

2d.

Price per ton (not to exceed $3.60 per ton)
to stockpile on behalf of the end user
and hold same in storage until December 31, 2013,

If end user takes delivery of its
total annual filed requirement by
Januar 1, 2013 indicate discount
from bid price if any:

If a minimum tonnage is required
to qualify for the above discount,
indicate said quantity:

Notwithstanding provisions under 2a
if end user guarantees that they will
take delivery of 90% of its annual filed
requirement by the end of the contract,
and advises contractor of this intention
by January 1, 2013 state discount from
bid price, if any: '

If a minimum tonnage is required to

qualify for the discount in 2¢ above,
indicate said quantity:

Have you submitted Information on your Inhibitor
Treatment?

Are you in agreement to offering

* a delayed billing program?

If yes, is your program the same as
stated in the Optional Delayed Billing
Program clause herein?

If your program differs from the
specification as described, please
attach your program to your bid and
check here:

(continued)

22513i.doc/T06jh .

$ 3.60 per ton

$_ None per ton .
N/A tons

$_ None ___perton
N/A tons
X YES - NO

YES __X _NO

YES NO




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower - 38thFloor
'Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 32100 - TREATED SALT
DATE: October 24, 2012 (DOT & Others)

TIME:  11:.00 AM

Classification Code(s):

INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: _ '
22513 . - As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 1, 2012 through October 31, 2013
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: Team #6
Joseph Hodder Team Leader Bruce Hallenbeck -Assistant Director
Telephone No. (518) 474-3668 Telephone No. (518) 408-1705
E-mail address: joseph.hodder@ogs.ny.gov E-mail address: bruce.hallenbeck@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate, By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
j () and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at: : i

Procurement Lobbying: http://www.ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgs/re ulations/defaultAdvisoryCouncil htmi
Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
’ (Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration™ clause)
48-1047632 100_0031899

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box [1 NYS Small Business [0 Minority Owned 1 Women Owned
(check all that apply): -___ #Employees Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

North American Salt Company, A Compass Minerals Company
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable); '

Street City : State Zip County
9900 West !09th St., Ste 100 Overland Park KS . 66210 Johnson
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box 00 Manufactured Within - Manufactured Outside
(check all that apply): New York State New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
[0 WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT JTHIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature: 8444\ % Printed or Typed Name: ', Son 847 kY

Title: D?ncjfm Date: /0/2 2/20/9\
Phone :(913)344 - 9101 ext ( ) Toll Free Phone : ( 800) 323 - 1641 ext( )
Fax :(913) 338 - 7945 ext ( ) Toll Free Fax . () - ext ( )

E-mail Address: beyersm@compassmnerals_ .com

Company Web Site: www. compassminerals . com

3

EOR PROCUREMINT SERVATAS GROUD TS DNE.
[ PR #22513 LT O MEMO O 1ET O  OTHER O MISSING PAGES

C-IFB.dotx(07/12)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 35 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY*S NAME IN THE BOX

D2 oD

Bidder
North American Salt Company,

A Compass Minerals Company

Finished
Stockpile Product Salt
Location Name Color

LOT 1- TYPE 1 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED
Filed

. OGS Require- | OGS Price/
County Item # ment Item # Unit
Albany 1 8,000 1 No Bid/Ton
Broome 2 200 2 $No Bid/Ton
Columbia 3 200 3 $No Bidirgp
Cortland 4 1,500 4 $No Bidroy
Essex 5 6,200 5  ¢$No Bidr,,
Franklin 6 1,000 6  $No Bidry,
Herkimer 7 1,600 7 $No Bigron
Jefferson 8 1,800 8 $No Bidirop
Lewis 9 550 9  $No Bidron
Madison 10 1,000 10  §No Bid/rg,
Oneida 11 750 11 gNo Bidmy,
Onondaga 12 5,100 12 $N° Bic;Ton
Schuyler & ‘ .
Yates 13 1,300 13 gNo Bidmy,,
Seneca 14 450 14 - $No Bidrgp
Steuben 15 90 - 15 $No Bidm,,
Sullivan 16 150 16  $No BidTop
Tompkins 17 500 17 $No Bigroy
Warren 18 2,000 18 $No Bidrey,
Washington 19 350 19 gNo Bidpg,

(continued)
22513i.doc/T06jh




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others) Page 5of 5
LOT1-TYPE 1- GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED : :
Filed Finished
0GS Require- | OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Salt
- County - Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color
Chenango 30 200 30 $ N_Q&A/T on

22513p1/T06jh



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 36 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=29 00 5 0

Bidder

North American Salt Company,
A Compass Minerals Company '

LOT1-TYPE 1 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED (Cont’d)
State mix method as required by
Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:
If you are not the owner/operator of
the mine, have you submitted the
Certificate of Manufacturer Form on

Page 427

Number of tons of salt that constitute a
truckload delivery: 22 Tons

22513i.doc/T06jh

Pugmill

Rideau Bulk & Buffalo Crushed Stone

Johnstown, ON & Buffalo, NY

Goderich, ON

Johnstown, ON

X YES

(continued)

NO




G_ROUP 32100 ~ TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 37 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

]

Bidder

North American Salt Company,
A Compass Minerals Company

Finished

Stockpile Product Salt

Location Name _ Color
Johnstown Thawrox Orange
Buffalo Thawrox Orange / Blue
Buffalo Thawrox Orange / Blue

A

Johnstown Thawrox Orange
Johnstown Thawrox Orange
Buffalo Thawrox Orange / Blue

Rideau Bulk & Buffalo Crushed Stone

Johpstown, ON & Buffalo, NY

LOT 2-TYPE 2 - GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED & ORGANIC BASED
PERFORMANCE ENHANCER
"~ Filed _
oGS Require- | OGS Price/
County Item # ment Item # Unit
Albany .20 400 20  gNo Bidp,
Clinton 21 2,500 21 $.78-8% /Ton
Dutchess 22 3,222 22 gNo Bidp,
Monroe . 23 800 23 $.%63 /Ton
Ontario 24 1,000 24 $57-56 /Ton
Otsego 25 300 25 $No Bid/Ton
Putnam 26 100 26 $N° Bidmon
St. Lawrence 27 500 27 $7°:38 /Ton
Warren 28 302 28 $82-48 /1o
Wayne 29 500 29~ $87-28 /Ton
State mix method as required by
Specification Item: Pugmill
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine: Goderich, ON
Location of Stockpile: Johnstown, ON

(continued)

22513i.doc/T06jh



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others) : PAGE 38 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN ‘Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE North American Salt Company,
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX A Compass Minerals Company

S DD DD

INFORMATION TO BE FURNISHED BY BIDDERS:

1. Price per ton (not to exceed $3.60 per ton)
to stockpile on behalf of the end user
and hold same in storage until December 31, 2013, .8 per ton

2a, If end user takes delivery of its
total annual filed requirement by
Januar 1, 2013 indicate discount
from bid price if any: $_ per ton

2b. If a minimum tonnage is required
to qualify for the above discount, N/A »
indicate said quantity: _ tons

2c. Notwithstanding provisions under 2a
if end user guarantees that they will
take delivery of 90% of its annual filed
requirement by the end of the contract,
and advises contractor of this intention
by January 1, 2013 state discount from 0.00
bid price, if any: $_ * _perton

2d. If a minimum tonnage is required to ‘
qualify for the discount in 2¢ above,
indicate said quantity: N/A tons

3. Have you submitted Information on your Inhibitor
* Treatment? ‘ * YES NO

4, Are you in agreement to offering
a delayed billing program? , YES NO

If yes, is your program the same as
stated in the Optional Delayed Billing

Program clause herein? YES NO

If your program differs from the
specification as described, please
attach your program to your bid and
check here:

(continued)
22513i.doc/T06jh



State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower - 38thFloor ~
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS |

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY _

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 32100 - TREATED SALT
DATE: October 24, 2012 o (DOT & Others)
TIME: 11:00 AM
Classification Code(s):
INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22513 As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD: November 1, 2012 through October 31, 2013
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: Team #6
Joseph Hodder Team Leader Bruce Hallenbeck . Assistant Director
Telephone No. (518) 474-3668 Telephone No. (518) 408-1705
E-mail address: joseph.hodder@ogs.ny.gov E-mail address: bruce.hallenbeck@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an anthorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
i (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at: .

Procurement Lobbying: http://www.ogs.ny.gov/aboutO siregulations/defaultAdvisoryCouncil html

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) . {See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
[6-1605064d - j00000 04 &3 |
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box B NYS Small Business [ Minority Owned [ Women Owned
’ (check all that apply): ' /) #Employees | Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: . ‘ .
SWP Enterprises LLC '

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

N A A . .
Street . - City . tate =~ Zip ounty
(1399 Stete Routen, Wef ford NY j45 72 _ Steuben
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropridte box 7 & Manufactured Within ¥ Manufactured Outside
(check all that apply): New York State New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and retumn this page only.
0O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature: ' Printed or Typed Name;
,gn . Ookhypl—-', Hoe ke r
Title: Vie e Pkeas-‘lde.r\‘r ' Date: _
Phone : (&ys”) a8~ 39770 ext ( ) Toll Free Phone : ( ) VIA - ext( ).
Fax (ges) 128 -G998l ext( ) _TollFreeFax = : ( ) Nj& - ext( )
E-mail Address:{ A 4 %, ) se 5““' ompany Web Site: www; swp e nte <
v FOR® MENT SERVICES GROUP USE ONLY

[PR.#22513 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES _ ~ |

C-IFB.dotx(07/12)



GROUP 32100~ TREATED SALT (DOT & Others) | PAGE 35 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID.
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

S DD DD

BE SURE YOU HAVE

Swp E‘n""rpm‘.sas_Ltc; |

LOT 1-TYPE 1- GRANULAR

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED '
: Filed
OGS Require-

County Item # ment
Albany 1 8,000
Broome 2 200
Columbia 3 200
Cortland 4 1,500
Essex 5 6,200
Franklin 6 1,000
Herkimer 7 1,600
Jefferson 8 1,800
Lewis 9 550
Madison 10 1,000
Oneida 11 750
Onondaga 12 5,100
Schuyler

‘ 13 1,300
Seneca 14 450
Steuben 15 90
Sullivan 16 150
Tompkins 17 500
Warren 18 2,000
Washington 19 350
y stes A0

225131.doc/TO6jh

0GS

Item #

1

2

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

a0

Finished

Price/ Stockpile Product Salt
Unit Location Name Color

wP

_M_/l‘on u)v.ﬂu\& Ny ‘%—udd : B‘Neléru.h
SWp :

$_7/:37/Ton uﬂqA‘ vy j'gg gt Z{Zr¢¢n

) £8.8 Ton - glani,ﬂy tg«.te Bloe. zgrc en

82449 fon  Waylosd VY Trentd Blue/ereen
$2LA Ton (oo nd WY ’ﬂwﬁ.fg Blos [eyecn
$.97. 9{Ton Wayh AW Treatid Blveftreen
$.42.13 /Ton Wo.y o nd Wy ﬁ, ,'4 Bive /Cree
$20:99 /ton - (Wayle end Ny Mswﬁ ML
$81.23/Ton w}’ :z co.-fﬂ{. é e/l reen
$.Z§:_°li/1'09 (‘{AM/ fcu,'hd B g/écu»\
$729.95/Ton 142”1 /ug4 W) Troattes 4“) ::."h/ B/ ;/Ar«u A

Swe .

74 /49, 29 /Ton QZ MZ u‘{, "),V I—C-Lq.-t(i B[Qez dre,.‘,,\
: - SweP
$ b6 (YTon Wo.# lo. ggﬂ” Z‘¢$=g= gJ I
> Swp sen

$£.£,q'[/1"on éd W/‘]‘:&w‘fcd Bh)g%/re.on
5 .S’MP
$54. (oglron w/ Blve /6reen

$94:89Ton (ﬂﬂ-zlk'ﬂl ﬂ))l g0 Bilve [Qr&cn
S(UP
$:2}429 /Ton @2 ¥/¢ld W :[',:gg"l;J B/gg l&gzc.p

5.9 Ton Waylasd M .S’bl;': Blue
$95. 211 __)L_l_d,_ /.%g‘ﬁ Ite/Breen |
ﬁluc[&'mgn

SQLYL Ton  Wayland NY 7 pot |
1568 Tan Werleah® T554 0 plae/aren

(continued)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 36 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

5 59 0D 25

Bidder

WP € htt)"O—r;Ses LiC

LOT1-TYPE 1-GRANULAR
SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED (Cont’d)
State mix method as required by
Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile: -

If you are not the owner/operator of
the mine, have you submitted the

Certificate of Manufacturer Form on .

Page 427

Number of tons of salt that constitute a
truckload delivery: 30-3¢ _Tons

22513i.doc/TO6jh

3¢r¢\A)I/F¢L3.
SWP En T-C—?,D/:IS&.S' LLg

JA)O-}//CL V\,J;N Y
mt _Vno'rr..sj Ny

.UU c»\I//& Ml’ f\)y

X

YES

(continued)

NO .



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 37 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= 2D oD D>

Bidder

SWPr En‘\'e.r,orfSe-.s,.LLc_

LOT 2 - TYPE 2 - GRANULAR

SODIUM CHLORIDE TREATED
WITH LIQUID MAGNESIUM
CHLORIDE CORROSION
INHIBITED & ORGANIC BASED
PERFORMANCE ENHANCER
Filed
0GS Require-
County Item # ment
Albany 20 400
Clinton 21 2,500
Dutchess 22 3,222
Monroe 23 800
Ontario 24 1,000
Otsego 25 300
Putnam 26 100
St. Lawrence 27 500
Warren 28 302
Wayne 29 500

State mix method as required by

Specification Item: _

Name of Refiner;

Location of Refinery:

Location of Mine;:

‘Location of Stockpile:

225131.doc/T06jh

' Finished _
0GS Price/ Stockpile Product - Salt
Item#  Unit Location Name Color

20 S_N_&/I‘on
21 $ lL/T on
22 $ _MLII‘ on
23 $ M8 sron
24 $ _&ﬂ‘ on
25 $SNB _mon
26 $ VB fron
27 $MB ITon
28 sAB /Ton
29 $ M_ /Ton
(continued)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT (DOT & Others)

PAGE 38 of 58

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
e —

Bidder

SWwP Eh"\'-l.«r)afl‘Se;.c Lic

INFORMATION TO BE FURNISHED BY BIDDERS:

1.

2a

2b.

2.

2d.

22513i.doc/TO6jh

Price per ton (not to exceed $3.60 per ton)
to stockpile on behalf of the end user
and hold same in storage until December 31, 2013.

If end user takes delivery of its
total annual filed requirement by
Januar 1, 2013 indicate discount
from bid price if any:

If a minimum tonnage is required
to qualify for the above discount,
indicate said quantity:

Notwithstanding provisions under 2a
if end user guarantees that they will
take delivery of 90% of its annual filed
requirement by the end of the contract,
and advises contractor of this intention
by January 1, 2013 state discount from
bid price, if any: '

If a minimum tonnage is required to
qualify for the discount in 2¢ above,
indicate said quantity:

Have you submitted Information on your Inhibitor
Treatment? :

Are you in agreement to offering
a delayed billing program?

If yes, is your program the same as
stated in the Optional Delayed Billing
Program clause herein?

If your program differs from the
specification as described, please
attach your program to your bid and
check here:

(continued)

s Jo0

per ton

$ NZA' . per ton
”)/A' tons

$ nj[ A "_perton

s

tons

Y YES NO

YES X NoO

YES NO




